
ADDENDUM NO.: 2 DOCUMENT 00 90 01 
JULY 15, 2015 
FEDERAL BUILDING 
ARVIAT, NUNAVUT  
 

Parkin Architects Limited 
20 James Street, Suite 200 
Ottawa, Ontario, K2P0T6         Tel: (613) 739-7700; Fax: (613) 739-7780 

 

1.1 ADDENDUM 

.1 INTENT 

.1 This Addendum is issued during Bidding and shall form part of Bidding and Contract 
Documents for above Project. 

.2 Except as otherwise specified herein, work required by this Addendum shall be in 
accordance with specifications dated  April 07, 2015 and Drawings accompanying same 
and previously issued Addenda (if any). 

1.2 CIVIL - DRAWINGS 

.1 DRAWING NO: C-1 

.1 Drawing No. C-1 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: C-1, dated July 17, 
2015 and forms part of this Addendum. A new concrete slab was added to support the fuel 
vault & sewage tanks.  To achieve the required distance of 750mm from the bottom of the 
tank to the top of the main floor, the tank now sit on a 9’-0” high, pre-manufactured stand. 
Both the fuel vault & sewage tanks were moved southward approximately 600-700mm 
towards the front of the building to avoid any interference with the service stair & to also 

maintain the same clearance between the tanks.  

1.3 ARCHITECTURAL - SPECIFICATIONS- DIVISIONS 0 TO 33 INCLUSIVE 

.1 DOCUMENT 00 43 22, SUPPLEMENTRAY BID FORM UNIT PRICES– VOLUME 1 

.1 Delete Section 00 43 22 SUPPLEMENTRAY BID FORM UNIT PRICES and replace it in its 
entirety as appended and forming part of this Addendum. 

.2 DOCUMENT 05 50 00, METAL FABRICATIONS– VOLUME 1 

.1 Delete Section 05 50 00 METAL FABRICATIONS and replace it in its entirety as appended 
and forming part of this Addendum. 

.3 DOCUMENT 09 21 16, GYPSUM BOARD– VOLUME 2 

.1 Add  Subparagraph  2.3.3.7: as follows: 

.1 Expanded  Metal Security Mesh: ASTM A1011/A1011M, non-galvanized steel securi-
ty mesh sheets consisting of steel panels used for resistance to penetration behind 
gypsum board partitions where scheduled on Drawings. 

1. Medium Grade Security Mesh: Provide “ASM.75-13F” by AMICO or ap-
proved equivalent with following characteristics: 

a. Weight: 3.66 kg/m2 (0.75 lbs/ft2);  
b. Mesh Size Opening: 17.5 mm x 45.3 mm (0.688” x 1.782”)  
c. Thickness: 1.8 mm (0.070”);  
d. Open Area: 73%; 

2. Attachment Method: Clips: Provide manufacturer’s recommended tam-
per-resistant clips complete with appropriate threaded fasteners.  

 



ADDENDUM NO.: 2 DOCUMENT 00 90 01 
JULY 15, 2015 
FEDERAL BUILDING 
ARVIAT, NUNAVUT  
 

.4 DOCUMENT 09 51 00, ACOUSTIC CEILING TILES– VOLUME 2 

.1 Modify Materials Article 2.3.15.4. (ACT-1) as follows: 

.1 Delete 610 mm x 610 mm x 19 mm (24”x 24”) incombustible mineral fibre 

.2 Add 1220 mm x 610 mm x 19 mm (48”x 24”) incombustible mineral fibre 

.5 DOCUMENT 10 22 26, FOLDING PANEL OPERABLE PARTITIONS – VOLUME 2 

.1 Delete section 10 22 26 Folding Panel Operable Partitions in its entirety.  

.6 DOCUMENT 10 28 00, ACCESSORIES– VOLUME 2 

.1 Delete Section 10 28 00 ACCESSORIES and replace it in its entirety as appended and 
forming part of this Addendum. 

.7 DOCUMENT 10 95 00, MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALITIES– VOLUME 2 

.1 Delete Section 10 95 00 MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES and replace it in its entirety as 
appended and forming part of this Addendum. 

1.4 ARCHITECTURAL - SCHEDULES 

.1 DOOR AND SCREEN SCHEDULE 

.1 Delete Door 107C from Door and Screen Schedule. 

.2 Delete Door 107C from Hardware Schedule. 

.3 Delete Accessories Schedule in its entirety and replace it with new accessories schedule as 
appended and forming part of this Addendum. 

1.5 ARCHITECTURAL - DRAWINGS 

.1 DRAWING NO: 1408-A003 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A003 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A003.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.2 DRAWING NO: 1408-A100 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A100 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A100.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.3 DRAWING NO: 1408-A100 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A100 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A100.2, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.4 DRAWING NO: 1408-A120 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A120 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A120.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.5 DRAWING NO: 1408-A400 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A400 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A400.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.6 DRAWING NO: 1408-A501 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A501 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A501.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

.7 DRAWING NO: 1408-A503 



ADDENDUM NO.: 2 DOCUMENT 00 90 01 
JULY 15, 2015 
FEDERAL BUILDING 
ARVIAT, NUNAVUT  
 

.1 Drawing No. 1408-A503 is modified as follows by attached Sheet Number: 1408-A503.1, 
dated July 17, 2015. 

 

1.6 STRUCTURAL – SPECIFICATIONS 

.1 DOCUMENT 06 14 00, TREATED WOOD FOUNDATIONS– VOLUME 1 

.1 Delete Subsection 1.4.2. as FSC certified lumber is not required, all that is required is PWF 
(preserved wood foundation) rated wood. 

.2 DOCUMENT 31 36 00, GABIONS – VOLUME 2 

.1 Add new section 31 36 00 Gabions, appended to this Addendum. 

1.7 STRUCTURAL – DRAWINGS 

.1 DRAWING NO. S001- Design Specifications & Drawing Notes 

.1 Structural Consultant has modified Drawing No. S001 by adding Gabion Basket Drawing 
Note Section as follows by attached Sheet Number: SR-S001.01, dated July 14, 2015 and 
forms part of this Addendum.  

.2 DRAWING NO. S101- Design Specifications & Drawing Notes 

.1 Structural Consultant has modified Drawing No. S101 by adding W360 x 33 steel beam 
between Grid Lines B - C & 7 – 8 and W360 x 33 steel beam between Grid Lines C - D & 7 
– 8  as follows by attached Sheet Number: SR-S101.01, dated July 17, 2015 and forms part 
of this Addendum.  

.3 DRAWING NO. S500 

.1 Structural Consultant has modified Drawing No. S500 to add Section 2/S500 as follows by 
attached Sheet Number: SR-S500.01, dated July 17, 2015 and forms part of this 
Addendum. Refer to sketch SR-S500.01 issued herein. 

1.8 MECHANICAL – SPECIFICATIONS 

.1 N/A 

1.9 MECHANICAL – DRAWINGS 

.1 DRAWING NO. M100 

.1 Mechanical Consultant has modified Drawing No. M100 as follows by attached Sheet 
Number: M100, dated July 17, 2015 and forms part of this Addendum. A new concrete slab 
was added to support the fuel vault & sewage tanks.  To achieve the required distance of 
750mm from the bottom of the tank to the top of the main floor, the tank now sit on a 9’-0” 
high, pre-manufactured stand. Both the fuel vault & sewage tanks were moved southward 
approximately 600-700mm towards the front of the building to avoid any interference with 

the service stair & to also maintain the same clearance between the tanks.  

.2 DRAWING NO. M106 

.1 Mechanical Consultant has modified Drawing No. M106 to revise fire extinguisher locations 
as follows by attached Sheet Number: M100.01-Add2, dated July 17, 2015 and forms part 
of this Addendum. Refer to sketch MR-M100.01-Add2 issued herein.  

.3 DRAWING NO. M610.1 



ADDENDUM NO.: 2 DOCUMENT 00 90 01 
JULY 15, 2015 
FEDERAL BUILDING 
ARVIAT, NUNAVUT  
 

.1 Mechanical Consultant has modified Drawing No. M610.1 to revise pumps P-3, P-4, P-5 & 
P-6 locations to Room 003 as follows by attached Sheet Number: MR-M610.01, dated July 
17, 2015 and forms part of this Addendum.  
 

.4 DRAWING NO. M610.2 

.1 Mechanical Consultant has modified Drawing No. M610.2 to revise size of sewage tank T-8 
as follows by attached Sheet Number: MR-M610.02, dated July 17, 2015 and forms part of 
this Addendum.  

1.10 ELECTRICAL 

.1 DRAWING NO. E100 – Arctic Vents 

.1 Electrical Consultant has modified Drawing No. E100 as follows by attached Sheet Number: 
SK-E1 and SK-E2, dated July, 2015 and forms part of this Addendum. Connect all Arctic 
Vents to circuit A-58 w/ 2c#12 AWG in EMT, as shown on drawing E100. There are 4x 
Arctic Vents which are located in rooms 107,118, 120, 124. Refer to mechanical drawing 
M101 for exact locations, and coordinate with mechanical trades.   

List of Attachments: 

PDF Files 

Civil Drawings              1 Page 

Architectural Schedules           2 Pages 

Architectural Drawings            7 Pages 

Structural Specifications           3 Pages 

Structural Drawings            3 Pages 

Mechanical Drawings            4 Pages 

Electrical Drawings            2 Pages 

END OF ADDENDUM  





     
FEDERAL BUILDING SUPPLEMENTARY BID FORM Section 00 43 22 
Arviat, NU UNIT PRICES Page  1 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015   

PART 1 -GENERAL 

1.1 PROJECT INFORMATION  

From (Name of Bidder): ________________________________________________   

To (Owner): ________________________________________________________    

1.2 UNIT PRICES 

.1 I/We the undersigned offer the following Unit Prices for the work or for 
deletion of flammable cabinet specified. All Unit Prices, unless 
specifically indicated, are for deletion of items in accordance with 
applicable Contract requirements. 

.2 I/We the undersigned agree that the Owner shall have the right to delete 
items as per Unit Prices listed hereunder. Prices listed hereunder do not 
include The Harmonized Sales Tax (HST) but include all other eligible taxes.  

.3 We hereby submit following Unit Prices for full duration of Contract for 
Work, executed in accordance with Contract Documents. 

.4 ITEM OF WORK       UNIT COST/UNIT  
            

.5 Flammable Cabinets in accordance with  $               ___/unit 

requirements of Section 10 95 00. 

.6 This list of Unit Prices is an integral part of these Bid Documents. 

1.3 ADDRESS, LEGAL STATUS AND SIGNATURE OF BIDDER 

.1 We hereby designate the address, given below as the legal address to which 
all notices, directions or other communications may be served or mailed: 

 

Street___________________________________________________________ 
 
City_______________________________  Province_________________ 

Postal Code _____________  

.2 We hereby declare that the Bidder has legal status stated below: 
 

Individual____________________Partnership________________________                             

Corporation incorporated under the laws of  

________________________________ Date____________________________ 



     
FEDERAL BUILDING SUPPLEMENTARY BID FORM Section 00 43 22 
Arviat, NU UNIT PRICES Page  2 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015   
.3 This Supplementary Bid Form is submitted under seal in the name: 

 

_____________________________________________________________________            

(Company Name - Typed) 

           

By____________________________                                     
            
     (Signature) 

 

Name_________________________                                             
    (Typed) 

Title__________________________ 

 

Signed and sealed this ______________ day of _________________, 20___. 

 

END OF DOCUMENT 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 1 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

PART 1 -GENERAL 

1.1 GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS 

.1  Read and conform to:  
.1  the General Conditions and Supplementary Conditions  of the Contract; 
.2  Division 1 requirements and documents referred to t herein.  

1.2 SUMMARY 

.1  Work Included: Provide metal fabrications including but not limited to 
following: 
.1  galvanized commercial mesh 
.2  exterior handrails and guardrails. 
.3  exterior steel stairs and landings. 
.4  steel ladders. 
.5  operable partition supports. 
.6  overhead door jambs and headers. 
.7  floor trench and sump pit cover plates. 
.8  Bollards, bumper posts and rails. 
.9  metal locker bases. 
.10  supports for architectural woodwork including bench es and 

countertops. 
.11  miscellaneous sections and framing. 

.2  Related Requirements: Specifications throughout ent irety of Divisions of 
this Project are directly applicable to this Sectio n, and this Section is 
directly applicable to them. 

1.3 REFERENCES 

.1  Reference Standards:  
.1  Latest published edition of reference standards lis ted herein are 

applicable to this Project unless otherwise indicat ed.  
.2  Reference amendments adopted prior to the effective  date of this 

Project are applicable unless otherwise indicated. 

1.4 ADMINISTRATIVE REQUIREMENTS 

.1  Sequencing: Coordinate installation with related Se ctions referenced 
herein. 

.2  Pre-Installation Meetings: 
.1  Regulatory Requirement Review Meeting: Provide pre- start regulatory 

requirement review meeting to parties associated wi th work of this 
Section. As a minimum, discuss following:  
.1  environmental procedure requirements,  
.2  health, safety and emergency response procedure and  policy 

requirements,  
.3  and security requirements; 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 2 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.2  Pre-construction Site Meeting:  
.1  Prior to start of work, arrange for Project site me eting of 

parties associated with work of this Section, inclu ding 
non-exhaustively Subcontractor performing work of t rade 
involved, testing company's representative and Cont ractor's 
consultants of applicable discipline. Consultant ma y attend.  

.2  Review Contract Documents to permit compliance with  intent of 
this Section for work included under this trade, an d ensure 
complete understanding of requirements and responsi bilities 
relative to:  
.1  work included,  
.2  materials to be used,  
.3  storage and handling of materials,  
.4  installation of materials,  
.5  sequence and quality control,  
.6  Project staffing,  
.7  restrictions on areas of work and other matters aff ecting 

construction.  

.3  Scheduling: 
.1  Prior to commencing work of this Section arrange fo r manufacturer’s 

technical representative to review with Contractor and Consultant, 
procedures to be adopted and conditions under which  work shall be 
performed. Inspect surfaces to determine adequacy o f proposed 
conditions. 

.2  Co-operate fully with other Subcontractors on the W ork and promptly 
proceed with work of this Section as rapidly as job  conditions permit. 

.3  Co-operate with other Sections for application of a ll miscellaneous 
specialties. 

.4  Supply items to be built-in in ample time to be inc orporated into work 
of other Subcontractors, together with measurements  and other 
information required for location of it. 

.5  Ensure work which may create dust does not proceed during work related 
to painting and final finishing.  

1.5 SUBMITTALS 

.1  Product Data:  
.1  Submit manufacturer's literature and data sheets fo r each type of 

material provided under this Section for Project in  accordance with 
requirements of Division 01. Ensure data sheets Pro vide required 
information including detailed instructions for ins talling as well 
as maintaining, preserving and keeping materials in  clean and safe 
conditions. Provide adequate warning of maintenance  practices or 
cleaning agents detrimental to specified materials.  

.2  Material Safety Data Sheets: Submit MSDS for inclus ion in Operation and 
Maintenance Manual without limitations for adhesive s, sealants and other 
materials designated later by Consultant. 

.3  Shop Drawings: Submit Shop Drawings for work of thi s Section in accordance 
with Division 01. In addition to minimum requiremen ts indicate following: 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 3 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.1  large scale details of members, materials and conne ctions. 

.2  jointing details. 

.3  methods of setting, sealing, securing, anchorage. 

.4  field connections. 

.5  Submit Shop Drawings for following work bearing the  stamp of a 
Professional Engineer registered in the Territory o f Nunavut: 
.1  handrails, pipe handrails and balustrades. 
.2  steel stairs. 
.3  supports for suspended items.  

.4  Samples: Submit samples in accordance with Division  01. Submit following 
samples in sizes indicated: 
.1  extruded and formed metals: minimum 300 mm (12") lo ng. 
.2  metal sheet: minimum 300 mm (12") square and of spe cified thickness. 

1.6 QUALITY ASSURANCE 

.1  Installer’s Qualifications: Provide work of this Se ction executed by 
competent installers with minimum 5 years’ experien ce in manufacture, 
application of metal fabrication work and assemblie s specified; with 
approval and training of manufacturers. Demonstrate  experience of Projects 
of similar scope and size, and evidence of a contin uing quality assurance 
program for both materials and installation crews. 

.2  Welding:  
.1  Provide welding in accordance with CSA W59-M perfor med by a fabricator 

and mechanics fully approved by the Canadian Weldin g Bureau as 
specified herein. 

.2  Ensure fabricator is fully certified by Canadian We lding Bureau for 
fusion welding of steel structures to CSA W47.1 and  for fusion welding 
of aluminum to CSA W47.2.  

.3  Licensed Professionals: Employ a full time professi onal structural engineer 
registered in the Territory of Nunavut, carrying mi nimum $2,000,000.00 
professional liability insurance to: 
.1  design the components of the work of this Section r equiring structural 

performance, non-exhaustively including the followi ng:  
.1  stairs including landings and supports. 
.2  balustrades, handrails, railings. 
.3  suspended supports.  

.2  be responsible for full assemblies and connections  

.3  be responsible for determining sizes, yield strengt hs, gauge 
thicknesses and joint spacing to allow thermal move ment and loading 
of components in accordance with applicable codes a nd regulations,  

.4  be responsible for production and review of Shop Dr awings, 

.5  inspect the work of this Section during fabrication  and erection, 

.6  stamp and sign each shop drawing, 

.7  Provide site administration and inspection of this part of the Work. 

.8  Submit certificate validating seismic assessment an d field review of 
this part of the Work 

.4  Certification: 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 4 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.1  Welders employed on this Project may be asked by Consultant at any 
time for their welding certificate. 

1.7 DELIVERY, STORAGE AND HANDLING 

.1  Delivery and Acceptance Requirements:  
.1  Coordinate deliveries to comply with construction s chedule and 

arrange ahead for strategic off-the-ground, underco ver storage 
locations. Do not load areas beyond designed limits . 

.2  Handle and store metal materials at job to prevent damage to other 
materials and to adjacent construction. 

.2  Storage and Handling Requirements: Handle component s with care, and Provide 
protection for surfaces against marring or other da mage. Ship and store 
members with cardboard or other resilient spacers b etween surfaces. Use 
lifting chokers of material which will not damage s urface of metal members. 

PART 2 -PRODUCTS 

2.1 DESCRIPTION 

.1  Regulatory Requirements: 
.1  The Work of this section that functions to resist f orces imposed by 

dead and live loads shall conform to latest require ments of National 
Building Code of Canada and those of jurisdictional  authorities.  

.2  Performance/Design Criteria: 
.1  Architectural Drawings and details are diagrammatic  and are only 

intended to show design concept, aesthetics, interf acing 
requirements, configuration, components and arrange ments. They are 
not intended to identify or solve completely proble ms of thermal and 
structural movements, assembly framing, engineering  design, fixings 
and anchorages 

.2  Design work of this Section to withstand within acc eptable deflection 
limitations, specified tolerances in vertical and h orizontal planes, 
its own weight, forces applied by movements of buil ding structure and 
attached adjacent components, and maximum design lo ads due to 
pressure and suction of wind, snow, ice, rain and h ail. 

.3  Design load bearing structures to National Building  Code of Canada 
requirements and Provide miscellaneous steel suppor ts and anchors to 
suit design. Conform to CAN/CSA-S16.1 and CAN/CSA-S 136.  

.4  Design free standing handrails and guardrails to th e requirements of 
the National Building Code of Canada. Ensure handra ils and guard rails 
connections are made of welded constructions unless  indicated 
otherwise. Make adequate provision for differential  thermal and 
structural movement of component parts of system an d fastenings, to 
prevent opening of joints, undue stress on fastenin gs or other 
detrimental effects. 

.5  Design and detail angle lintels, steel pipe railing s, handrails, 
guardrails and balustrades in accordance with NBCC and CAN/CSA B651. 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 5 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 
2.2 MATERIALS 

.1  Structural Shapes, Plates, Etc.: New material confo rming to CSA G40.20 and 
CSA G40.21, Grade 300W. 

.2  Hollow Structural Sections: New material conforming  to CSA G40.20 and CSA 
G40.21, Grade 350W, Class H. 

.3  Steel Pipe: ASTM A53/A53M, Type E or S, Grade A or B, Standard weight, 
Schedule 40. 

.4  Stainless Steel 
.1  Stainless Steel Sheet, Strip, Plate, and Flat Bar: ASTM A167 or ASTM 

A666, Type 304 and Type 316 alloy with exposed surf aces having No. 
4 polished finish. Sizes as required to meet design  requirements. 

.2  Exterior Stainless Steel Sheet, Strip, Plate, and F lat Bar: ASTM A666, 
Type 316. 

.3  Provide highest architectural quality in various forms, str aight and 
true. Ensure there are no scratches, scars, creases , buckles, ripples 
or chatter marks. Provide finish surfaces suitable for polishing 
where required. Ensure finished surfaces exposed to  view are free of 
pitting, seam marks, roller marks, oil-canning, sta ins, 
discolourations or other imperfections. 

.4  Refer to Drawings for extent of stainless steel work. 

.5  Welding Materials: Conforming to CSA W48.1-M and CS A W59-M. 

.6  Security Screws for Cells, Secure Interview Rooms, Prisoner Showers where 
prisoners may be alone, at areas in unsupervised lo cations to suit design 
requirements:  
.1  Complying with ANSI B 18.6.3; Provide only tamper-resistant Torx- 

Plus® or break off type screws as specified and not ed on Drawings.  
.2  Provide flathead security screws where Torx- Plus® or brea koff is 

indicated to be counter sunk otherwise provide only  trusshead or 
buttonhead for Torx- Plus® and only roundhead for b reakoff type.  

.3  Torx- Plus® Temper resistant screws with heads havi ng a deep 
hex-lobular recess with a solid post formed in the centre requiring 
a special metal driver to install or remove screw.  

.4  Fasteners and tools shall be of type produced by li censed 
manufacturer.  

.5  Break-Off head security screws with drive heads hav ing an additional 
hexagonal shaped head designed to break off after i nstallation at a 
predetermined torque level.  

.6  Grind remaining portion of neck smooth after hex-he ad is broken off. 
Acceptable manufacturers, Temper Proof Screws Inc o r Folger Adam 
Security Inc, or Sentry Security Fasteners, Inc. or  Temper proof Screw 
Co Inc.; www.temperproof.com. 

.7  High Strength Bolts: Supply bolts, nuts and washers conforming with ASTM 
A325M. Supply each type and size of bolt and nut of same manufact ure and 
of same lot. 
.1  Bolts: Heavy, hexagon head high strength structural  bolts, of 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 6 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

standard size, of lengths required for thick-ness o f members joined 
and for type of connection. 

.2  Nuts: Heavy hexagon semi-finished nuts. 

.3  Washers: For general use bolt, nut and stud applica tion to Provide 
increased bearing surfaces, spacing and to prevent galling. Flat and 
smooth hardened washers, quenched and tempered to s uit applications 
and conforms to ASTM F844. Provide AISI Type 304 stainless steel 
washers at exterior locations. 

.4  Hardened Steel Washers: To suit applications and co nforms to ASTM 
F436M. 

.5  Stainless Steel Bolts: To suit applications and con forms to ASTM 
F738M. 

.6  Stainless Steel Nuts: To suit applications and conf orms to ASTM F836M. 

.7  Lock Washers: Helical spring type steel “lock” wash ers to suit 
applications and conforms to Federal specification FF-W-84. Provide 
AISI Type 304 stainless steel lock washers at exter ior locations. 

.8  Exterior Vandal Resistant Fasteners: AISI Type 304 stainless steel, 
dual pin type vandal resistant fasteners to suit ap plications and 
acceptable to Consultant. 

.9  Security Fasteners: Button head Torx® Plus R screw tamper resistant 
# 10, 25 mm (1") long 2 per glass stop minimum stai nless steel machine 
screws. 

.8  Common or Ordinary Bolts and Anchor Bolts: Unfinish ed bolts conforming with 
ASTM A307, Grade A, with hexagon heads and nuts whe re exposed in the finish 
work. Supply common bolts of lengths required to suit thickness of material 
being joined, but not projecting more than 6 mm (1/ 4") beyond nut, without 
the use of washers. Supply anchor bolts of lengths noted, but projecting 
not less than 13 mm (1/2") beyond nut unless otherw ise noted. 

.9  Structural connectors; ASTM A10110/A1011M and ASTM A325M-09 heavy 
structural bolt, hexagonal nut and 1 hardened washe r. Steel Pipe Handrails: 
Conforming to ASTM A53/A53M, Type "S", Schedule 40,  Grade A steel pipe of 
sizes shown. 

.10  Steel Pipe Bumpers: Conforming to ASTM A53/A53M, Sc hedule 80 steel pipe of 
sizes shown. 

.11  Galvanizing: Hot dipped galvanizing with minimum zi nc coating of 600 g/m2 
to CAN/CSA-G164-M. 

.12  Galvanized Sheet Steel: Supply 0.91 mm (20 ga) core thickness commercial 
quality to ASTM A653/A653M, CS Type A, with Z275 zi nc coating designation 
to ASTM A653/A653M. 

.13  Aluminum Extrusions: ASTM B221M size accurately for med as shown on Drawings, 
extruded aluminum alloy AA-6063- T5 or T6 for alumi num. Ensure surfaces are 
free from defects impairing appearance, strength an d durability. 

.14  Aluminum Sheet: ASTM B209M, Minimum thickness 3 mm (1/8") of type and 
characteristics to match finished extrusions; sheet  which is not exposed 
shall be Utility Aluminum mill finished; for intric ate forming with 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 7 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

decorative finishes use AA 1100 and for siding and exposed panels use AA-3003 
with specified finish.  

.15  Grout 
.1  Cementitious, non shrinking, non expanding grout: ‘ Sika Grout 212' 

by Sika Canada Inc., or ‘Non Shrink Structural Grou t - Dry Pack Grout’ 
by Euclid Chemical Company or ‘Sealtight CG 86 Cons truction Grout’ 
by W.R. Meadows. 

.2  Epoxy, non-shrinking, non expanding grout: ‘Sika An chor Fix’  

2.3 DECORATIVE COMPONENTS 

.1  Non-Security Galvanized Commercial Mesh (at buildin g perimeter and at 
handrails at stairs and ramps): 
.1  13 mm (1/2") x 50 mm (2") x 0.162" diameter, galvan ized, smooth  weave 

style carbon steel wire mesh  conforming to ASTM A1 011, panel length 
width to suit design requirements. Design based on “3120 Plus Deco” 
by McNichols Products, www.mcnichols.com or approve d equivalent by 
Gerard Daniel Worldwide, Canadian Division, www.ger alddaniel.com or 
W.S.Tyler-Wire Cloth Products www.wstyler.com . 

.2  Anchors, fasteners and hardware as recommended by m anufacturers. 

.3  Exterior Paint Finish: Refer to Section 09 91 00. 

2.4 FABRICATION 

.1  Fabricate each item of work of this Section in acco rdance with following 
general requirements: 
.1  members square and straight. 
.2  members plumb and true. 
.3  joints accurately and tightly fitted. 
.4  intersecting members in true, flush planes. 
.5  fasteners concealed. 
.6  steel connections. 

.2  Fabricate, fit and assemble work in shop where poss ible. Where shop 
fabrication is not possible, make trial assembly in  shop. 

.3  Provide hangers, rods, bars, bolts, anchors, brackets, rive ts, bearing 
plates and bracing, fitting, drilling, stopping, so ldering, as required for 
a complete assembly. 

.4  Insulate dissimilar metals to prevent galvanic corr osion. 

.5  Weld connections unless otherwise indicated. 

.6  Shop Welding: 
.1  Execute welding to avoid damage or distortion to wo rk. Should there 

be, in the opinion of Consultant or Inspection Company, doubt as to 
adequacy of welds, they shall be tested for efficie ncy and any work 
not meeting Standards be removed and replaced with new work 
satisfactory to Consultant. Carry out welding in accordance with 
following standards: 
.1  Fabricator shall be fully certified by Canadian Wel ding Bureau 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 8 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

for fusion welding of steel structures to CSA W47.1  and for 
fusion welding of aluminum to CSA W47.2. 

.2  CSA W48-M - for Electrodes (If rods are used, only coated rods 
are allowed). 

.3  CSA W59-M - for design of connections and workmansh ip. 

.4  CAN/CSA W117.2 - for safety. 

.7  Thoroughly clean welded joints and steel exposed fo r a sufficient space to 
properly perform welding operation. Neatly finish w elds. Ensure welds 
exposed to view and finish painted are continuous a nd ground smooth. 

.8  Provide exposed metal fastenings and accessories of same ma terial, texture, 
colour and finish as base metal to which they are a pplied or fastened. 

2.5 FINISHES 

.1  Cleaning and Shop Painting: 
.1  Clean steel to SSPC SP6 and remove loose mill scale , weld flux and 

splatter. 
.2  Shop prime steel with 1 coat of primer paint to dry  film thickness 

of 0.025 mm (1 mil). Paint on dry surfaces, free fr om rust, scale, 
grease. Do not paint when temperature is lower than  7 deg C (45 deg 
F). Paint items under cover and leave under cover u ntil primer is dry. 
Follow paint manufacturer's recommendations regardi ng application 
methods, equipment, temperature, and humidity condi tions. 

.3  Shop prime non galvanized perimeter steel members a nd structural 
steel members to receive sprayed fire resistive mat erials with 1 coat 
of high performance corrosion protection primer to dry film thickness 
of 0.025 mm (1 mil). Paint on dry surfaces, free fr om rust, scale, 
grease. Do not paint when temperature is lower than  7 deg C (45 deg 
F). Paint items under cover and leave under cover u ntil primer is dry. 
Follow paint manufacturer's recommendations regardi ng application 
methods, equipment, temperature, and humidity condi tions. 

.4  Shop prime galvanized steel in accordance with CAN/ CGSB-85.10. 

.5  Clean but do not paint surfaces being welded in the  field and surfaces 
in contact after assembly. 

.2  Hot Dip Galvanizing: 
.1  After fabrication, hot dip galvanize specific misce llaneous steel 

items noted on Drawings or specified herein. Plug r elief vents air 
tight. After galvanizing, remove plugs, ream holes to proper size and 
re-tap threads. Straighten shapes and assemblies tr ue to line and 
plane after galvanizing. Galvanize following member s: 
.1  members exposed to elements in final location;  
.2  members embedded on exterior side of exterior walls ;  
.3  members embedded in concrete;  
.4  members specified in this Section or noted on Drawi ngs. 

.2  Hot-dip galvanize members, in accordance with and t he requirements 
of following ASTM A153/A153M, standards, with minim um coating weights 
or thicknesses as specified: 
.1  Rolled, Pressed and Forged Steel Shapes, Plates, Ba rs and 

Strips: ASTM A123/A123M; average weight of zinc coa ting per sq 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 9 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

ft of actual surface,  
.1  For members having thickness of 4.8 mm (3/16") and less: 

2 ounces  
.2  For heavier members: 2.3 ounces. 

.2  Iron and Steel Hardware: ASTM A153/A153M; minimum w eight of zinc 
coating, in ounces per sq ft of surface in accordan ce with Table 
1 of ASTM A153/A153M, for various classes of materi als used on 
Project. 

.3  Steel Sheet: ASTM A653/A653M; weight of zinc coatin g, per sq 
ft on both sides of sheet. Coating designation Z275  (G90) 
minimized spangle and chemically treated. 

.3  Zinc-rich primer: Ready, mixed, zinc-rich primer co nforming to 
CAN/CGSB-1.181 for new galvanized metal. Acceptable  Products: “Zinc Clad 
III HS” by Sherwin Williams Company of Canada Ltd.,  or approved equivalent. 

.4  Galvanized Primer Paint, Field Touch-Up Paint and R epair to Damaged 
Galvanized Surfaces: Zinc rich ready mix organic CG SB 1-GP-181M and in 
compliance with CGSB 85-GP-16M. Acceptable Products : Glidden ICI "Devoe 
Catha Coat 13034" or “Zinc Clad III HS” by Sherwin Williams Company of Canada 
Ltd., or approved equivalent. Conform to manufactur er’s recommendations. 
Colour: Identical to affected surface.  

.5  Exposed Aluminum Surfaces: Clear anodized coating ( Architectural Class II). 
Pre-treat aluminum with caustic tech treatment prio r to applying integral, 
clear, anodic oxide coating. Apply clear, anodic ox ide coating in accordance 
with AAMA 611, 0.4 mils minimum coating thickness a nd to Aluminum Finish 
Designation AA-M12C22A31, Architectural Class II. P rotect clear anodized 
coating with removable protective film. 

.6  Dielectric Separator: Acid and alkali resistant iso lation coating to 
Provide dielectric separation between cementitious surfaces and metals. 
Provide best grade, quick drying, non-staining alka li resistant asphalt 
utility enamel by approved manufacturer to Provide dielectric separation 
and which will dry to be tack-free and able to with stand high temperatures. 
Acceptable Products: “Carboline Bitumastic 50” by C arboline Canada, or 
“Copper Creek Top Service 760 Black” by Sherwin Wil liams Company, “410-02” 
by Bakor Inc. or approved equivalent.  

PART 3 -EXECUTION 

3.1 INSTALLATION 

.1  Verify dimensions at the Place of The Work to ensure work of this Section 
fits to that of other parts of The Work. 

.2  Erect The Work of this Section plumb, square, true and level. 

.3  Securely anchor work of this Section and rivet, wel d or bolt to structural 
framing of the building. Where secured to concrete,  Provide bolts for 
setting in concrete.  



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 10 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 
.4  Provide necessary fitting, setting and cutting required in connection with 

the fitting of work of this Section to other parts of The Work. 

.5  Field Painting: Paint bolt heads, washers, nuts, fi eld welds and previously 
unpainted items. Touch up with matching paint, shop  primer damaged during 
transit and installation. 

.6  Erect stair work to line, plumb, square, true and l evel, with runs of stairs 
registering level with floor levels. 

3.2 CLEANING 

.1  On completion of installation, carefully clean meta l work. 

3.3 SCHEDULES 

.1  EXTERIOR HANDRAILS AND GUARDRAILS 
.1  Pipe Handrail: 

.1  Material and finish: Provide minimum 3 mm wall thickness, Type 
302 stainless steel handrail pipe. 

.2  Material and finish: Provide minimum 3 mm wall thickness hot 
dip galvanized prime painted steel with urethane fi nish. 

.3  Outside diameter: 38 mm 

.4  Provide closed pipe ends and grind welds smooth. 
.2  Provide minimum Type 302 stainless steel hot dip galvanized  brackets 

and escutcheons and finish to match handrails. 
.3  Stainless steel finish: XL Blend S 
.4  Fabricate as detailed. 

.2  EXPANDED METAL STAIRS AND BALUSTRADE (EXTERIOR) 
.1  Stringers: minimum 250 x 12.5 MC prime painted stee l channel sections. 

.1  Stringer end cover plate: minimum 6 mm (1/4") conti nuous prime 
painted steel, welded. 

.2  Provide clip angles and anchor bolts to attach treads. 

.3  Finish: galvanized finish 
.2  Tread and riser carrier bars (horizontal): minimum 30 mm x 30 mm x 

6 mm prime painted steel angles, welded to the stee l stringers. 
.1  Finish: prime finish 

.3  Treads and landings: minimum 12 ga sheet steel, wel ded 
.1  Treads: diamond treads and landings of Expanded Met al 

Corporation Unitread, sized to suit. 
.2  Finish: galvanized. 
.3  Pan depth: 38 mm. 
.4  Projection: 25 mm. 
.5  Reinforce tread and landing nosings with 2 - 10 ga gusset plates. 
.6  Bolt treads and landings to horizontal carrier angl es. 

.4  Risers: open. 

.5  Balustrade: 
.1  Balustrade posts: minimum 50 mm x 50 mm HSS. 
.2  Balustrade pickets: minimum 12 mm diameter. 
.3  Balustrade and wall bracket finish: galvanized. 
.4  Balustrade and wall handrail covering: vinyl, by Re hau Inc. 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 11 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

Profile and colour shall be later selected by Consultant. 

.3  STEEL LADDERS 
.1  Provide galvanized steel ladders for following locations: 

.1  One ladder in each elevator pit from 1500 mm above last floor 
served to bottom of pit. 

.2  On vertical exterior walls for roof access where in dicated. 
.2  Obtain exact locations of ladders from the Consultant where not 

otherwise indicated. 
.3  Provide 6 mm galvanized steel checker plate platform and 38  mm x 38 

mm x 6 mm angle framing for ladders. 
.4  Provide a hot dip galvanized steel safety cage from 2200 mm  from the 

finished roof to 900 mm above the parapet. 

.4  LADDER SAFETY CAGES (if applicable)  
.1  General: Fabricate ladder safety cages to comply wi th ANSI A14.3 and 

local OHSA requirements. Assemble by welding. 
.2  Finish: Galvanize exterior ladders; prime paint int erior ladders. 

.5  OPERABLE PARTITION SUPPORTS 
.1  Provide structural steel plates and support rods in accorda nce with 

the operable door manufacturer's detail requirement s. 
.2  Brace support system against lateral movement. 
.3  Finish: alkyd prime painted. 

.6  OVERHEAD DOOR JAMBS AND HEADERS 
.1  Provide HSS, channel framing and 6 mm plate steel closures to profile 

as indicated. 
.2  Finish: Galvanized steel. 

.7  OVERHEAD DOOR TRACK AND OPERATOR ANCHORAGE 
.1  Provide inside jamb extensions, centre spring mount and mot or 

supports in accordance with the manufacturer's inst ructions. 

.8  FLOOR TRENCH AND SUMP PIT COVER PLATES 
.1  As detailed. 
.2  Finish: Galvanized 
.3  Provide perimeter gasket for air tight seal at pits connect ed with 

sanitary drainage piping. 

.9  BOLLARDS 
.1  Bollards: 6 mm thick x 300 mm round diameter HSS. 

.1  Finish: galvanized. 
.2  Concrete fill and bases provided as part of work of  Section 03 30 00. 
.3  Bollards installed as part of this Section. 

.10  METAL LOCKER BASES 
.1  Provide as detailed.  
.2  Finish: Galvanized steel. 

.11  ARCHITECTURAL WOODWORK 
.1  Provide miscellaneous steel items required as part of The Work of 

Section 06 40 00, e.g.: valance supports, vanity su pport brackets. 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING METAL FABRICATIONS Section 05 50 0 0 
Arviat, NU  Page 12 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.1  Finish: prime finish. 

.12  MISCELLANEOUS SECTIONS AND FRAMING 
.1  Provide miscellaneous steel sections which are not shown or  

identified on Structural Drawings, or specified under another Section 
of Specifications. 

.2  Provide steel framing and supports indicated and as  necessary to 
complete the Work and which are not a part of the s tructural framework, 
including but not limited to: 

.1  operable partitions,  

.2  countertop and vanities,  

.3  benches 

.4  projection screens,  

.5  ceiling hung televisions and cameras,  

.6  tube framing for partial height walls,  

.7  mechanical and electrical equipment. 
.2  Fabricate units from structural-steel shapes, plate s, and bars 

of welded construction, unless otherwise indicated.  Fabricate 
to sizes, shapes, and profiles indicated and as nec essary to 
receive adjacent construction retained by framing a nd supports. 
Cut, drill, and tap units to receive hardware, hang ers, and 
similar items. 

END OF SECTION 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  1 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

PART 1 -GENERAL 

1.1 GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS 

.1  Read and conform to:  
.1  the General Conditions and Supplementary Conditions  of the Contract ; 
.2  Division 1 requirements and documents referred to t herein.  

1.2  SUMMARY 

.1  Work Included: Provide  accessories including but not limited to following : 
.1  boot rack (BR) 
.2  clothing hooks (CH)  
.3  electric hand dryer (EHD) 
.4  grab bar (GRB) - including standard grab bar, L-sha ped grab bar, 

flip-up grab bar and additional reinforcing for gra b bars in bariatric 
areas 

.5  janitorial unit (JU) 

.6  mirror (MIR)  

.7  paper towel dispenser unit (PTD) 

.8  paper towel dispenser/disposal unit (PTDD) 

.9  soap dispensers (SD) 

.10  shower seats (SHT.ST)  

.11  sanitary napkin/tampon disposal unit (SND) 

.12  stainless steel shelf (SSS) 

.13  toilet tissue dispensers (TTD-1)  

.14  towel bar (TWB) 

.15  wire shelf (DW) 

.2  Related Requirements: Specifications throughout ent irety of Divisions of 
this Project are directly applicable to this Sectio n, and this Section is 
directly applicable to them. 

1.3 REFERENCES 

.1  Reference Standards: 
.1  ASTM A167-99(09): Standard Specification for Stainl ess and 

Heat-Resisting Chromium-Nickel Steel Plate, Sheet, and Strip 
.2  ASTM C1503-08: Standard Specification for Silvered Flat Glass Mirror 
.3  CSA W59-03(08): Welded Steel Construction (Metal Ar c Welding) 
.4  CSA B651-12: Accessible Design for the Built Enviro nment 

1.4 ADMINISTRATIVE REQUIREMENTS 

.1  Sequencing: Coordinate installation with related Se ctions referenced 
herein. 

.2  Pre-Installation Meetings: 
.1  Regulatory Requirement Review Meeting: Provide pre- start regulatory 

requirement review meeting to parties associated wi th work of this 
Section. As a minimum, discuss following:  



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  2 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.1  environmental procedure requirements,  

.2  health, safety and emergency response procedure and  policy 
requirements,  

.3  and security requirements; 
.2  Pre-construction Site Meeting:  

.1  Prior to start of work, arrange for Project site me eting of 
parties associated with work of this Section, inclu ding 
non-exhaustively Subcontractor performing work of t rade 
involved, testing company's representative and Cont ractor's 
consultants of applicable discipline. Consultant ma y attend.  

.2  Review Contract Documents to permit compliance with  intent of 
this Section for work included under this trade, an d ensure 
complete understanding of requirements and responsi bilities 
relative to:  
.1  work included,  
.2  materials to be used,  
.3  storage and handling of materials,  
.4  installation of materials,  
.5  sequence and quality control,  
.6  Project staffing,  
.7  restrictions on areas of work and other matters aff ecting 

construction.  

.3  Scheduling: 
.1  Prior to commencing work of this Section arrange fo r manufacturer’s 

technical representative to review with Contractor and Consultant, 
procedures to be adopted and conditions under which  work shall be 
performed. Inspect surfaces to determine adequacy o f proposed 
conditions. 

.2  Co-operate fully with other Subcontractors on the W ork and promptly 
proceed with work of this Section as rapidly as job  conditions permit. 

.3  Co-operate with other Sections for application of a ll miscellaneous 
specialties. 

.4  Supply items to be built-in in ample time to be inc orporated into work 
of other Subcontractors, together with measurements  and other 
information required for location of it. 

.5  Ensure work which may create dust does not proceed during work related 
to painting and final finishing. 

1.5 SUBMITTALS 

.1  Product Data : Submit manufacturer's literature and data sheets for each type 
of material provided under this Section for Project in accordance with 
requirements of Division 01. Ensure data sheets Provide required 
information including detailed instructions for ins talling as well as 
maintaining, preserving and keeping materials in cl ean and safe conditions. 
Provide adequate warning of maintenance practices or cleani ng agents 
detrimental to specified materials. 

.2  Material Safety Data Sheets: Submit MSDS for inclus ion in Operation and 
Maintenance Manual for following items without limi tations: adhesives, 
sealants and other items designated later by Consultant . 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  3 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 
.3  Shop Drawings : Submit Shop Drawings  for work of this Section in accordance 

with Division 01. Ensure Shop Drawings  indicate material characteristics, 
details of construction, connections and relationsh ip with adjacent 
construction. Submit Shop Drawings  in form of catalogue cuts and fully 
illustrate specified materials with description of components, surface 
finishes, hardware and securement devices. 

.4  Samples: Submit complete samples of each accessory and modular unit to 
Consultant  for review of construction quality, materials and finish prior 
to delivery of required quantities of items. Submit  sample of each colour 
where applicable. No trademark and/or labels are ac ceptable on exposed 
finishes.  

.5  Maintenance Instructions: Submit maintenance instru ctions in accordance 
with Division 01 . Submit an accessories schedule, keys and parts manu al as 
part of Project closeout documents. Submit 2 sets of following item s of 
manufacturer's literature: 
.1  Technical Data Sheets of each item used for the Project . 
.2  Service and Parts Manuals. 
.3  Name of local representative to be contacted in the  event of need of 

field service of consultation. 

1.6 QUALITY ASSURANCE 

.1  Installers: Provide Work of this Section executed by competent installe rs 
with minimum of 5 years’ experience in application of Products , systems and 
assemblies specified and with approval and training  of the Product 
manufacturers. 

.2  Single Source Responsibility: Ensure primary materi als provided in this 
Section are obtained from 1 source by a single manu facturer and secondary 
materials are obtained from sources recommended by primary materials 
manufacturers.  Ensure  Products  for work of this Section are keyed alike to 
extent possible. 

1.7 DELIVERY, STORAGE AND HANDLING 

.1  Deliver materials in sealed cartons and containers with manufacturer’s name 
and Product description clearly marked thereon. 

1.8 WARRANTY 

.1  Warrant mirrors of this Section for period of 10 ye ars against defects and 
deficiencies in accordance with General Conditions of the Contract.  
Promptly correct defects or deficiencies which beco me apparent within 
warranty period, to satisfaction of Consultant  and at no expense to Owner. 
Defects include but are not limited to: deteriorati on of mirror’s silvering.  

PART 2 -PRODUCTS 

2.1 MANUFACTURERS 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  4 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 
.1  Products  of following manufacturers are acceptable subject to conformance 

to requirements of Drawings , Schedules and Specifications : 
.1  ASI/Watrous, Inc. A division of ASI; www.americansp ecialties.com   
.2  Bobrick Washroom Equipment of Canada Ltd.; www.bobr ick.com 
.3  Bradley Corporation; www.bradleycorp.com    
.4  Elcoma Barrier Free Products ; www.elcoma.com 
.5  Frost Washroom Accessories; www.fcfrost.com 
.6  HealthCraft Products  inc.; www.healthproducts.com  
.7  Kimberley Clark; www.kimberly-clark.com 
.8  Koala Kare; www.koalabear.com 
.9  Securing Cosmos; www.securitycosmos.com  
.10  Mistubishi; www.mitsubishijettowel.com 
.11  Dyson; www.dysonairblade.com 
.12  Metropolitan Wire Ltd.; www.metro.com  

.2  Substitution Limitations: This Specification is bas ed on Products from 
manufacturers listed herein. Comparable Products  from manufacturers not 
listed herein will be considered provided they meet  the requirements of this 
Specification. 

2.2 DESCRIPTION 

.1  Regulatory Requirements: 
.1  Install systems in accordance with Code regulations  concerning access 

of physically challenged and disabled persons. Comp ly with CAN/CSA 
B651. 

.2  Design/Performance Requirements:  
.1  Provide accessories as specified with options indic ated. Model 

numbers may not reflect all options required. 
.2  Provide stainless steel collars to accommodate semi -recessed 

mounting of units whose depth exceeds wall cavity d epth. 
.3  Edges of sheet metal which are accessible to users or maintenance 

personnel shall be pneumatically sanded to yield sm ooth safe edges 
with no sharpness.  

.4  Mount items with concealed fasteners unless otherwi se indicated or 
unavoidable. Where exposed fasteners are unavoidabl e, use 
tamper-resistant type.  

.5  Where indicated, Design and manufacture suicide-res istant products 
in order to minimize risk of suicide in correctiona l facilities. 
Conform to suicide-resistant or anti-ligature requi rements of ADAAG 
(Americans with Disabilities Act Accessibility Guid elines). 

2.3 MATERIALS 

.1  Ensure accessories are stainless steel conforming t o ASTM A167, Type 304 
or Type 302, of 1 type throughout, ANSI No. 4 mecha nical brushed finish, 
of contemporary design, with minimum material thick nesses of components as 
specified herein. Arrange stainless steel sheet so grain of brushed finish 
runs vertically in finished installation. 
.1  Minimum thickness, any location or component:0.645 mm 
.2  Hygienic accessory - exposed double pan doors and p anels: 0.645 mm 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  5 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.3  Hygienic accessory - exposed single pan doors: 1.26  mm 

.4  Reinforcement: 1.26 mm 

.2  Concealed Sheet Steel Reinforcing: Refer to Section  09 21 16. At bariatric 
locations, Provide toggle bolt fasteners as specifi ed herein to Provide 
additional strength. 

.3  Provide accessories as specified with options indicated. Mo del numbers may 
not reflect all options required. 

2.4 MANUFACTURED UNITS 

.1  Boot Rack (BR-1): Supply vertical surface mounted r ack with 1.519 mm (16ga) 
steel posts and 1.214 mm (18ga) flip-up steel shelv es. Steel shall be 
Zinc-Coated (Galvanized). 4 flip-up shelves per sec tion unit. Provide all 
required hardware and accessories for complete inst allation.  
.1  Size: 864 mm x 1500 mm x 355 mm (34”w x 4’11”h x 14 ”d) 
.2  Provide 1 of the following:  

.1  “48W/34W SML Wall Mounted Book Racks” by Shanahan’s ; 
www.shanahans.com or approved equivalent.  

.3  Finish: baked enamel, colour to be selected at a la ter date from 
manufacturer's standard range. 

.2  Clothing Hook (CH-1): Supply 1 per washroom and as indicated on drawings, 
satin finished stainless steel, double hook type su pplied with backplates 
and screws. Mount items at heights indicated on Dra wings. Provide 1 of 
following: 
.1  Model No. B-682 by Bobrick,  
.2  Model No. 9134 by Bradley. 
.3  Model No. 7382 by ASI/Watrous 

.3  Clothing Hook – Multiple (CHM): Supply hooks  mounted on strip in locations 
indicated on drawings, satin finished stainless ste el, double hook type 
supplied with backplates and screws. Mount items at  heights indicated on 
Drawings. Provide 1 of following: 

.1  Model No. B-232 by Bobrick  

.2  Model No 9943 by Bradley 

.3  approved equivalent by ASI  

.4  Clothing Hook and Handicapped Hook Strip – Multiple  (CHMS and HCHMS):  
.1  Provide hooks mounted on strip and designed to carr y maximum load of 

16 kg (35 lb) without failure. Ensure clothing hook s fail when loaded 
beyond limit stipulated above. Provide units capabl e of having 
adjustable failing point under load by means of adj usting 1-way vandal 
proof screws with special tool. Minimum 3 hooks per  strip.  

.2  Supply in designated mental health areas , satin finished stainless 
steel, multiple hook type with rear mounting system  supplied with 
backplates and screws. Mount items at heights indic ated on Drawings. 

.3  Provide 1 of following: 
.1  CHMS-1 and HCHMS-1: 

.1  Model No. B-985 by Bobrick  

.2  approved equivalent by Bradley 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  6 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.3  approved equivalent by ASI  

.5  Safety/Suicide Resistant Clothing Hook and Handicap ped Hook (CHS and HCHS):  
.1  Provide door hooks designed to carry maximum load of 16 kg (35 lb) 

without failure. Ensure clothing hooks fail when lo aded beyond limit 
stipulated above. Provide units capable of having adjustable failing 
point under load by means of adjusting 1-way vandal  proof screws with 
special tool. 

.2  Supply 1 per shower stall and washroom in designated menta l health 
areas , satin finished stainless steel, single hook type w ith rear 
mounting system supplied with backplates and screws . Mount items at 
heights indicated on Drawings. Provide 1 of following: 
.1  Model No. B-983  (Stainless steel hook and bracket)  by Bobrick.  
.2  Model No. SA35 (Stainless steel hook and bracket) b y Bradley. 
.3  Model No. 123 (Stainless steel hook and bracket) by  ASI/Watrous. 

.6  Wall Mounted Clock (CLK): 
.1  Refer to Division 26. 

.7  Electric Hand Dryers (EHD): ADA Compliant, Surface mounted warm air hand 
dryers with sensor operation. Provide high speed type with adjustable 
speed/temperature. Ensure units come complete with anti-microbial 
resistant exterior surfaces. Provide 1 of following:  
.1  Sensor Operation (High Speed Type): Ensure units co me complete with 

anti-microbial resistant lacquer on exterior surfac es.  
.1  "AirbladedB-AB14" by Dyson. 
.2  "Jet Towel" by Mistubishi. 
.3  "Tri-Umph" by ASI/Watrous. 

.8  Grab Bar (GRB): Stainless steel, 32 mm (1-1/4") out side diameter, 1.21 mm 
(18 ga) wall thickness with peened finish to Provide positive gripping 
surface unless otherwise indicated. Provide items complete with standard 
mounting plates, flanges and accessories. Ensure gr ab bars can support 
minimum load of 113 kg (250 lbs). 
.1  Standard Horizontal or Vertical Grab Bar (GRB-1): M ount as shown on 

Drawings . Provide 1 of following:  
.1  Model No. B-5806.99x24 Series by Bobrick. 
.2  Model No. 812x24 Series by Bradley. 
.3  Model No. 3100-01x24 Series by ASI/Watrous. 

.2  Vertical L-Shaped Grab Bar (GRB-2): Provide vertical L-Shaped grab 
bar. Mount as shown on Drawings . Provide following::  
.1  Model No. 3100-04  (30x30) by ASI/Watrous or approved equivalent 

by Bobrick, Bradley or Elcoma. 
.3  Grab Bar (GRB-3): Not Used. 
.4  Flip Up Grab Bar (GRB-4): Ensure grab bars are capa ble of rotating 

90o in vertical direction. Mount as shown on Drawings with columns 
or carriers recommended by manufacturer. Provide following:  
.1  Model No. B-4998.99 by Bobrick 
.2  Model No. 3413P by ASI/Watrous 
.3  Model No. 96-2230PW05– PEENED GRIP by Elcoma; www.e lcoma.com  

.9  Janitorial Unit (JU): Supply 865 mm (34") long stainless steel utility shelf 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  7 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

complete with stainless steel hooks and spring-load ed rubber mop/broom 
holders: 
.1  Model No. B-223x36 by Bobrick.       
.2  Approved equivalent by Bradley. 
.3  Approved equivalent by ASI/Watrous. 

.10  Mirror (MIR-1): Supply 6 mm (1/4") polycarbonate mirror with inter-Lok 
stainless steel Type 304 (18-8) 1.21 mm (18 ga) No.  4 satin finish. Provide 
minimum 0.457 mm thick (26 ga) galvanized sheet ste el backing and Tamper 
resistant fasteners.  
.1  Size: (MIR-1): 460 mm X 910 mm (18” X 36”) 

.11  Provide 1 of following: 
.1  Model No. “0600 series” by ASI/Watrous. 
.2  Model No. “B-290 series”  by Bobrick. 
.3  Model No. “780 series” by Bradley. 

.12  Paper Towel Dispenser Units (PTD-1): Compact Height  (711 mm – 28”); Surface 
Mounted stainless steel construction with C-folded or multi-folded towel 
dispensing mechanism. Provide Type 304 (18-8) 0.8 mm (22 ga) stainless steel 
door complete with full length heavy duty stainless  steel piano hinge. 
Provide 1 pin type tumbler lock: 

.1  Model No. B-262 by Bobrick. 

.2  Model No. 250-15 by Bradley. 

.3  Model No. 0210 by ASI/Watrous. 

.13  Medium Capacity Stainless Steel Combination Paper T owel Dispenser/Disposal 
Unit (PTDD-1): Full Length; surface mounted stainle ss steel construction 
with metal waste receptacle and C-folded, multi-fol ded or single folded 
towel dispensing mechanism. Provide Type 304 (18-8) 1.519 mm (16 ga) 
stainless steel door complete with full length heav y-duty stainless steel 
piano hinge. Provide 2 pin type tumbler locks keyed alike: 
.1  Model No B-380349  by Bobrick 
.2  Model No 2017-11 by Bradley  
.3  Model No 64676-9 by ASI/Watrous 

.14  Soap Dispensers (SD-1): Liquid type. 
.1  Vertically Wall Mounted Type (SD-1): minimum 1.2 L (40 oz) capacity 

container with soap level gauge and integral filler  cap. Provide 1 
of following:: 
.1  Model No. B-2111 by Bobrick. 
.2  Model No. 6562 by Bradley  
.3  Model No. 0347 by ASI/Watrous 

.15  Solid Phenolic Folding Shower Seats (SHT.ST): Solid  phenolic folding shower 
seat manufactured from 1 piece solidly fused plasti c laminate with matte 
finish. Frame to be Type 304 (18-8) 1.519 mm (16 ga ) stainless steel with 
satin finish. Provide stainless steel piano hinge along 1 side. Other sid e 
to have 3 mm (1/8") thick 19 mm (3/4") x 19 mm (3/4 ") stainless steel support 
angle. Provide 1.519 mm (16 ga) retaining clip to hold seat in upr ight 
position when not in use. Provide 1 of following: 
.1  Model No. B-5191 by Bobrick. 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  8 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

.2  Model No. 9562 by Bradley. 

.3  Model No. 8203 by ASI/Watrous. 

.16  Sanitary Napkin and Tampon Disposal Unit (SND): sur face mounted, stainless 
steel construction, satin finish with self-closing door. Provide 1 of 
following: 
.1  Surface mounted Type:  

.1  Model No. B-270 by Bobrick. 

.2  Model No. 4781-15 by Bradley. 

.3  Model No. 20852 by ASI/Watrous.  

.17  Stainless Steel Shelf (SSS-1): Surface mounted shel f fabricated from 1.27 
mm (18 ga), Type 304 stainless steel in satin finis h. Provide units complete 
with integral brackets. Provide 1 of following:  
.1  Model No. B-298x18 by Bobrick  
.2  Model No. 758-18 by Bradley  
.3  Model No. 0692-818 by ASI/Watrous 

.18  Safety Toilet Tissue Dispenser (TTD-1): Supply safe ty toilet tissue 
dispenser manufactured from impact resistant solid polymer material with 
collapsible dowels. Provide following: 
.1  Model No. 817-S15 – SafeSupport® Impact Resistant T P Holder by 

SecuringCosmos; www.securingcosmos.com or approved equivalent by  
Bobrick or  Bradley or ASI/Watrous. Size: As shown on Drawings. 

.19  Towel Bar (TWB): Circular towel bar with 19 mm - 25  mm (3/4” - 1”) outside 
diameter manufactured from Type 304 satin finished stainless steel with 
1.214 mm (18 ga) wall thickness. Provide units complete with standard 
mounting plates, flanges and accessories. Mount as shown on Drawings.  
.1  Size: 610 mm (24”) 
.2  Provide 1 of following: 

.1  Model No. B-530x24 by Bobrick. 

.2  Model No. 9065x24 by Bradley. 

.3  Model No. 7355-24 by ASI/Watrous. 

.20  Wire Shelf (DW-1): Supply direct wall mounted wire shelf, 610 mm (24”) long 
x 360 mm (14”) deep, Type 304 (18-8) 1.214 mm (18 g a) satin finish stainless 
steel complete with manufacturer’s accessories and hardware for complete 
installation. Provide 1 of the following: 

.1 “Super Erecta Shelf – Direct Wall Mount” by Metropol itan Wire (Canada) 
Ltd.  

.2 Approved equivalent.  



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  9 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 
2.5 FABRICATION 

.1  Fabricate accessories true, square, rigid, free fro m distortion and from 
defects detrimental to appearance and performance. Assemble sheet metal 
accessories by welding in accordance with CSA W59-M . Conceal welds, or grind 
smooth such as to be undetectable in finished work.  Unless approved by Owner, 
assembly fastenings, hardware fixings and mounting or installation devices 
shall be concealed in finished work. 

.2  Use non-corrosive metal fasteners of expansion type , toggle type or other 
approved type of positive, mechanical anchor as req uired to suit 
construction to which accessory is to be mounted. E xposed fasteners, where 
permitted, shall be finished to match adjacent acce ssory surface, and be 
countersunk. Where accessories are mounted to sheet  metal, Provide a 3 mm 
(1/8") thick minimum full-size metal back-up plate drilled and tapped to 
receive machine screws and finished to match adjace nt sheet metal surface. 

.3  Ensure frameless accessories have 1 piece fronts wi th 90 degree formed 
returns at their edges and openings. Ensure returns  are continuously welded 
and ground smooth at corners. Where accessory front s are framed, frame 
edges, both inside and outside, shall have 90 degre e formed returns 
continuously welded and ground smooth at corners. D oors shall also have 90 
degree formed returns. 

.4  Use concealed stainless steel piano hinges which ex tend full-length of 
hinged element. Ensure hinged elements have conceal ed, 
mechanically-retained, rubber bumpers for silent cl osing, and close flush 
with faces of fronts or frames. Locate hinges to af ford easy and unobstructed 
access to interiors taking into consideration locat ion of accessory 
relative to surrounding and adjacent items and fini shes. 

.5  Portions of sheet metal accessory interiors which a re visible in completed 
work shall be stainless steel. Changes in plane sha ll be formed or 
continuously welded and ground smooth. Sheet metal accessory parts 
concealed in finished installation shall be galvani zed or stainless sheet 
steel. Edges of sheet metal which are accessible by  users or maintenance 
personnel shall be hemmed for safety with no sharp edges. 

.6  Ensure lettering on accessories is silk screened wi th durable paint to 
withstand wear, or is engraved or embossed. Size, l ocation and type face 
of lettering is subject to approval. Ensure edges o f letters are straight 
and sharp. 

PART 3 -EXECUTION 

3.1 INSTALLATION 

.1  Provide necessary wall reinforcement conforming to ASTM F446 and capable 
of supporting a minimum of 1.3 kN (292 lbs) downwar d pull force for grab 
bars and any other accessories subject to human loa dings to protect 
occupants against consequences of failure (damage, accidents, harm or any 
other non-desirable event) whether or not detailed on Drawings and in 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING ACCESSORIES Section 10 28 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  10 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
 

accordance with manufacturer’s instructions. Provid e additional 
reinforcement in bariatric areas using toggle bolt fasteners at mounting 
plates to support minimum load of 227 kg (500lbs) d ownward pull.  

.2  Install accessories in accordance with manufacturer's print ed installation 
instructions. 

.3  Provide fastenings and mounting kits for accessories. 

.4  Verify wall opening for correct dimensions, plumbne ss of blocking or frames 
and other preparation that would affect installatio n of accessories. 

.5  Verify spacing of plumbing fixtures and toilet part itions that affect 
installation of accessories. 

.6  Securely fasten accessories, level and plumb using appropriate fastenings 
as recommended by manufacturer. 

.7  Provide corrosion resistant fastenings. Where fasteners are  exposed, use 
tamper-proof fasteners finished to match items secu red. 

.8  Locate accessories where indicated on Drawings  and where directed by 
Consultant . Obtain Consultant's  acceptance of exact locations. 

.9  Provide manufacturer's recommended anchoring systems. 

.10  Fit flanges of accessories snug to wall surfaces. 

.11  Refer to the Schedule of Washroom Accessories inclu ded with this Section 
and the Room Finish Schedule. 

3.2 ADJUSTING, CLEANING AND POLISHING 

.1  Remove protective coatings and paper including adhe sives. 

.2  Test mechanisms, hinges, locks and latches. 

.3  Adjust and lubricate to ensure washroom accessories  are in perfect working 
order. 

.4  Clean and polish mirrors, aluminum and stainless st eel surfaces. 

 

END OF SECTION  



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  1 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  

PART 1 -GENERAL 

1.1 GENERAL INSTRUCTIONS 

.1  Read and conform to:  
.1  the General Conditions and Supplementary Conditions  of the Contract; 
.2  Division 1 requirements and documents referred to t herein.  

1.2 SUMMARY 

.1  Work Included: Provide miscellaneous specialties including but not limite d 
to following: 
.1  stainless steel corner guards (CG) 
.2  flammable cabinet 

.2  Related Requirements: Specifications throughout ent irety of Divisions of 
this Project are directly applicable to this Sectio n, and this Section is 
directly applicable to them. 

1.3 REFERENCES 

.1  Definitions: 
.1  Installation:  

.1  This includes coordination with other Sections, lab our, 
material and equipment necessary for off-loading of  equipment, 
handling, storing and dismantling of parts if requi red.  

.2  Make provisions for transferring items to proper lo cation in 
building, connections to building services, coverin g and 
protecting, final removal of covering and protectio n and making 
ready as required to form fully operative equipment .  

.3  Install items with security fasteners and security anchoring 
devices in security areas.  

.2  Purchase: This includes labour, materials and equip ment necessary for 
purchase and delivery of equipment to site. 

.2  Reference Standards:  
.1  Latest published edition of reference standards lis ted herein are 

applicable to this Project unless otherwise indicat ed.  
.2  Reference amendments adopted prior to the effective  date of this 

Project are applicable unless otherwise indicated 

1.4 ADMINISTRATIVE REQUIREMENTS 

.1  Sequencing: Coordinate installation with related Se ctions referenced 
herein. 

.2  Pre-Installation Meetings: 
.1  Regulatory Requirement Review Meeting: Provide pre- start regulatory 

requirement review meeting to parties associated wi th work of this 
Section. As a minimum, discuss following:  
.1  environmental procedure requirements,  
.2  health, safety and emergency response procedure and  policy 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  2 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  

requirements,  
.3  and security requirements; 

.2  Pre-construction Site Meeting:  
.1  Prior to start of work, arrange for Project site me eting of 

parties associated with work of this Section, inclu ding 
non-exhaustively Subcontractor performing work of t rade 
involved, testing company's representative and Cont ractor's 
consultants of applicable discipline. Consultant ma y attend.  

.2  Review Contract Documents to permit compliance with  intent of 
this Section for work included under this trade, an d ensure 
complete understanding of requirements and responsi bilities 
relative to:  
.1  work included,  
.2  materials to be used,  
.3  storage and handling of materials,  
.4  installation of materials,  
.5  sequence and quality control,  
.6  Project staffing,  
.7  restrictions on areas of work and other matters aff ecting 

construction.  

.3  Scheduling: 
.1  Prior to commencing work of this Section arrange fo r manufacturer’s 

technical representative to review with Contractor and Consultant, 
procedures to be adopted and conditions under which  work shall be 
performed. Inspect surfaces to determine adequacy o f proposed 
conditions. 

.2  Co-operate fully with other Subcontractors on the W ork and promptly 
proceed with work of this Section as rapidly as job  conditions permit. 

.3  Co-operate with other Sections for application of a ll miscellaneous 
specialties. 

.4  Supply items to be built-in in ample time to be inc orporated into work 
of other Subcontractors, together with measurements  and other 
information required for location of it. 

.5  Ensure work which may create dust does not proceed during work related 
to painting and final finishing. 

1.5 SUBMITTALS 

.1  Product Data:  
.1  Submit manufacturer's literature and data sheets fo r each type of 

material provided under this Section for Project in accordance with 
requirements of Section 01 30 00. Ensure data sheet s provide required 
information including detailed instructions for ins talling as well 
as maintaining, preserving and keeping materials in  clean and safe 
conditions. Provide adequate warning of maintenance  practices or 
cleaning agents detrimental to specified materials.  

.2  Material Safety Data Sheets: Submit MSDS for inclus ion in Operation 
and Maintenance Manual without limitations for adhe sives, sealants 
and any other material later designated by Consulta nt. 

.2  Shop Drawings: Submit Shop Drawings indicating mate rial characteristics, 
details of construction, connections and relationsh ip with adjacent 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  3 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  

construction. Verify dimensions by field measuremen ts before fabrication 
and indicate measurements on Shop Drawings. 

.3  Samples: Submit samples if requested by Consultant in minimum 300 mm x 300 
mm (12” x 12”) size. 

.4  Test and Evaluation Reports: Submit test data subst antiating that proposed 
materials meet performance criteria specified herei n. Submit independent 
test results showing properties and acceptable fire  hazard classification 
of applicable materials. 

.5  Certificates: Obtain certificate from Professional Engineer responsible 
for design which includes seismic assessment and fi eld review of this part 
of the Work, validating that work substantially com plies with requirements 
of the NBC and that requisite field reviews have be en completed 

.6  Maintenance Instructions: Submit maintenance instru ctions in accordance 
with Section 01 70 00. 

1.6 QUALITY ASSURANCE 

.1  Qualifications: Provide work of this Section execut ed by competent 
installers with minimum of 5 years’ experience in a pplication of Products, 
systems and assemblies specified and with approval and training of the 
Product manufacturers. 

.2  Licensed Professionals: Employ a full time professi onal structural engineer 
registered in the Territory of Nunavut, carrying mi nimum $2,000,000.00 
professional liability insurance to: 
.1  design components of The Work of this Section requiring structural 

performance  
.2  be responsible for full assemblies and connections  
.3  be responsible for determining sizes, joint spacing  to allow thermal 

movement and loading of components in accordance wi th applicable 
codes and regulations. 

.4  be responsible for production and review of Shop Drawings. 

.5  inspect work of this Section during fabrication and  erection. 

.6  stamp and sign each Shop Drawing. 

.7  Provide site administration and inspection of this part of The Work. 

.3  Single Source Responsibility: Ensure primary materi als provided in this 
Section are obtained from 1 source by a single manu facturer and secondary 
materials are obtained from sources recommended by primary materials 
manufacturers. 

.4  Mock-ups: Provide Mock-ups in locations designated by Consultant and as 
required to demonstrate quality of workmanship. Mai ntain Mock-ups during 
construction in an undisturbed condition as a stand ard for judging the 
completed work. 

1.7 DELIVERY, STORAGE AND HANDLING 

.1  Delivery and Acceptance Requirements: Comply with m aterial manufacturer’s 
ordering instructions and lead time requirements to  avoid delays.  



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  4 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  
1.8 WARRANTY 

.1  Warrant work of this Section for period of 3 years against defects and/or 
deficiencies in accordance with General Conditions of the Contract. 
Promptly correct any defects or deficiencies which become apparent within 
warranty period, to satisfaction of Consultant and at no expense to Owner. 
Defects include but are not limited to; buckling, o pening of seams, bond 
failure and extensive colour fading. 

PART 2 -PRODUCTS 

2.1 DESCRIPTION 

.1  Regulatory Requirements: 
.1  Fire performance characteristics: Provide wall prot ection system 

components having ULC or UL label indicating that t hey are identical 
to those tested in accordance with CAN/ULC S102.2 o r ASTM E84 for Class 
1 characteristics, with flame spread of 25 or less and smoke developed 
of 450 or less. 

.2  Install systems in accordance with Code regulations  concerning access 
of physically challenged and disabled persons.  

.3  Attach labels to electrical equipment attesting to CSA or Local 
Utility Company’s approval; provide magnetic starte rs for motors, 
transformers and overload protection. 

.2  Design and Performance Requirements:  
.1  As far as practical and unless otherwise indicated,  Provide PVC-free 

wall and door protection materials at scheduled loc ations except 
egress corridors as required to meet fire-resistanc e characteristics 
stipulated by authorities having jurisdiction. Use minimal amounts 
of PVC-based wall and door protection materials at egress corridors 
as indicated on Drawings and Schedules. 

.2  Wall and Door Protection:  
.1  Impact strength: Tested in accordance with applicab le 

provisions of ASTM F476. 
.2  Chemical and stain resistance: In accordance with A STM D1308. 

2.2 MANUFACTURED UNITS 

.1  Stainless Steel Corner Guards:  
.1  Surface Mounted Type: manufactured from 1.6 mm (16 ga.) Type 304 

stainless steel with #4 brushed finish complete wit h tamper-resistant 
fasteners or adhesive application as recommended by  manufacturers. 
Provide height to match door frames as shown on dra wings and 
schedules. Provide following: 
.1  CG-1: 90 o angle; 75 mm (3") wing length wing length and 3 mm  

(1/8”) corner radius; Products of following manufacturers are 
acceptable subject to conformance to requirements o f Drawings, 
Schedules and Specifications: 
.1  “C/S Model No. CO-8" by Construction Specialties Lt d.; 

www.c-sgroup.com or approved equivalent by InPro 
Corporation; www.inprocorp.com or Pawling Corporati on; 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  5 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  

www.pawling.com. 

.2  Flammable Cabinets: 
.1  Provide 1092 mm x 457 mm x 1651 mm (43” W x 18” D x  65” H)cabinet, 

double wall 18 ga. steel, self-closing doors and 2 adjustable shelves 
capable of holding 350 lbs. Provide following: 
.1  Model No. “H-1564S, Tag No.SE-9A – Yellow” by ULINE ; 

www.uline.com or approved equivalent. 
.2  Contract Price shall include for minimum 3 flammabl e cabinets 

for installations in locations designated. 
.3  Owner reserves right to reduce the number of cabine ts with 

credit for deletion in accordance with Document 00 43 22, 
Supplementary Bid Form – Unit Prices.  

2.3 FABRICATION 

.1  Accurately fit joints and intersecting members in t rue planes with adequate 
fastening. 

.2  Fit and assemble work of this Section in shop where  possible. Execute 
according to details and reviewed Shop Drawings. Where shop fabrication is 
not possible, execute trial assembly in shop. 

.3  Fabricate finished work free from distortion, weld splatter and defects 
detrimental to appearance and performance. 

.4  Edges of sheet metal which are accessible to users or maintenance personnel 
shall be pneumatically sanded to yield smooth safe edges with no sharpness.  

.5  Provide exposed metal fastenings and accessories of the sa me material, 
texture, colour and finish as the base metal to whi ch they are applied or 
fastened, unless otherwise specified. 

.6  Do not expose trademarks or labels on finished surf aces. 

2.4 ACCESSORIES 

.1  Provide accessories as a complete packaged system. 

.2  Sealants: Provide silicone sealants as recommended by manufacturer. 

.3  Adhesives: Provide adhesive as recommended by manufacturer. 

PART 3 - EXECUTION 

3.1 INSTALLATION 

.1  Conform to manufacturer’s printed instructions for accurate, secure 
installation. Ensure proper operation. 

.2  Provide work of this Section true to dimensions, square, p lumb, level and 
free from distortion or defects detrimental to appe arance and performance. 

.3  Provide all necessary reinforcing including but not limite d to steel stud 



    
FEDERAL BUILDING MISCELLANEOUS SPECIALTIES Section 10 95 00 
Arviat, NU  Page  6 
Project #1408  Apr 07, 2015  

backup and securely fasten components to suit desig n requirements. Ensure 
proper reinforcing has been provided as necessary. 

3.2 PROTECTION 

.1  Cover finished surfaces and protect exposed corners  and areas vulnerable 
to damage by persons or by movement of materials, t ools or equipment. 

 
END OF SECTION 



Abbreviation

BR-1 Boot Rack 34"

CH-1

CHM

CHS Safety Clothing Hook

CHMS safety/suicide resistant clothing hook- multiple

CLK

DW-1 Direct Wall Mount Shelf 14" x 24" 

EHD Electric Hand Dryer

GRB-1

GRB-2 765mm X 765mm (30" x 30") - L Shaped Vertical

GRB-4 Flip Up Grab Bar

HCHS Safety Handicapped Clothing Hook  - Mounted at 1200mm A.F.F.

HCHMS safety/suicide resistant handicapped hook- multiple

JU Janitors Unit 34"

MIR-1 Mirror Type 1 - 460mm X 910mm (18" x 36")  - including suicide resistant type

PTD-1 Paper Towel Dispenser 

PTDD-1 Combination Paper Towel Dispenser/Disposal Unit

SD-1 Soap Dispenser -Regular (Wall Mounted)

SHT.ST Shower Seat - including bariatric type

SND Sanitary Napkin/Tampon Disposal Unit 

SSS-1 Stainless Steel Shelf - (18"[455mm] x 8"[205mm])

TB-1 Aluminum Frame Tackboard (1000mm x 1220mm)

TTD-1 Toilet Tissue Dispenser (Surface Mounted) - including suicide resistant type

TWB Towel Bar 24" c/c

Clock 

610mm (24")

PROJECT NO. 1408-00

Accessories Schedule Abbreviations

Issued for Tender April 07, 2015

Description

Federal Building

Clothing Hook - Mounted at 1500mm A.F.F.

Clothing Hook - Mounted at 1500mm A.F.F.-multiple

Parkin Architects Limited 1 Page 1 of 1



Federal Building Section 10 28 00

Issued for Tender April 07, 2015

Flr Room # BR-1 CH-1 CHM CHS CHMS CLK DW-1 EHD GRB-1 GRB-2 GBR-4 HCHS HCHMS JU MIR-1 PTD-1 PTDD-1 SD-1 SHT.ST SND SSS-1 TB-1 TTD-1 TWB Remarks

L1 100 1

L1 101 1 1

L1 102 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1

L1 103 1 1

L1 104

L1 105 1 1

L1 106 1 1

L1 107 1 1 1 1 1 1

L1 108 2

L1 109 1 1

L1 110 2

L1 111

L1 112

L1 113 1 1 1

L1 114

L1 115

L1 116

L1 117 4

L1 118 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 Shower Rod and Curtain for shower

L1 119

L1 120

L1 121

L1 122

L1 123 1

L1 124 1

L1 125 1 1 1

L1 126 1 1 1 1 1 1

L1 127

L1 128 1 1 1 1

L1 129

L1 130

L1 131 1 1

L1 132 1

L1 133

L1 134

L1 135

L1 136

L1 137

L1 138

L2

PROJECT NO. 1408-00

ACCESSORIES SCHEDULE

Parkin Architects Limited 1 Page 1 of 1

















FEDERAL BUILDING GABIONS Section 31 36 00
                                                                               

Arviat, NU Page  1
Project #1408 Apr 07, 2015                                                                               

PART 1 - GENERAL

1.1      RELATED REQUIREMENTS           

.1 Entire Specification Book.

1.2      MEASUREMENT PROCEDURES           

.1 Measure gabions in cubic metres of stone filled baskets incorporated
into Work.

.2 Measure installation of gabions in cubic metres and include
excavation and preparation of foundation bed and supply, and
installation of graded stone fill and supply, and installation of
backfill.

1.3      REFERENCES           

.1 American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM)
.1 ASTM A 313/A 313M-98, Standard Specification for Stainless Steel
Spring Wire.
.2 ASTM A 764-95(2001), Standard Specification for Metallic Coated
Carbon Steel Wire, Coated at Size and Drawn to Size For Mechanical
Springs.

.2 Canadian Standards Association (CSA)
.1 CAN/CSA-G164-M92(R1998), Hot Dip Galvanizing of Irregularly
Shaped Articles.

PART 2 - PRODUCTS

2.1      MATERIALS           

.1 Gabion baskets:
.1 Factory fabricated so that sides, ends, lid and internal
diaphragms can be readily assembled at site into rectangular baskets
of sizes as indicated.
.2 Single unit construction or with joints having strength and
flexibility equal to that of mesh.
.3 Provide diaphragms of same mesh as gabion walls, when length
exceeds horizontal width. Diaphragms to divide basket into equal
cells of length not to exceed horizontal width.
.4 Wire mesh gabions:

.1 Wire mesh: uniform hexagonal pattern wire woven in triple
twist pattern with openings of approximately 75 x 75 mm,
non-ravelling.

                                                                               



FEDERAL BUILDING GABIONS Section 31 36 00
                                                                               

Arviat, NU Page  2
Project #1408 Apr 07, 2015                                                                               

.1 Wire mesh: uniform hexagonal pattern wire woven in triple
twist pattern with openings of approximately 75 x 75 mm,
non-ravelling.
.2 Securely selvedge perimeter edges to form joints connecting
selvedges with same strength as mesh body.
.3 Wire to have following dimensions:

.1 Mesh: 4.5 mm diameter Galfan covered.

.2 Selvedges: 4.5 mm diameter Galfan covered.

.3 Binding: connection rings @ 150 mm (max) installed
using the pneumatic spenax tool.

.4 Wire: Galfan coating with minimum coverage of 244 g/m2 to
CAN/CSA G164. 

.2 Stone fill:
.1 Hard, durable, abrasion resistant, capable of resisting
degradation from action of wetting and drying, wave action, freezing
and thawing cycles.
.2 Minimum 100 mm to maximum 200 mm dimension for individual
stones.

.3 Geotextile filter: in accordance with Section 31 32 19.01 -
Geotextiles.

PART 3 - EXECUTION

3.1      INSTALLATION           

.1 Install gabions and geotextiles to lines and grades as indicated.
Follow manufacturer's instructions in assembling baskets.

.2 Excavate for and backfill behind gabions in accordance with Section
31 23 33.01 - Excavating Trenching and Backfilling.

3.2      PLACING GABIONS           

.1 Wherever possible, place baskets in position prior to filling with
stones.

.2 Join adjacent baskets together at corners as recommended by
manufacturer, to ensure joints are as strong as mesh.

3.3      FILLING BASKETS           

.1 Tension geogrid gabions according to manufacturer's instructions
before filling with stone. Do not release wall tension until
sufficient stone fill has been placed to prevent wall slackening.

                                                                               



FEDERAL BUILDING GABIONS Section 31 36 00
                                                                               

Arviat, NU Page  3
Project #1408 Apr 07, 2015                                                                               

.2 On exposed faces of gabions, place stones by hand with flattest
surfaces bearing against face mesh to produce satisfactory alignment
and appearance.

.3 For wire mesh gabions, fill gabion cells in lifts not to exceed 300
mm and connect opposite walls with two tie wires after each lift.

.4 For geogrid gabions, fill cells in lifts not to exceed 300 mm and
connect opposite walls with two Galfan coated braids after each lift.

                                                                                END OF SECTION 




















	1408-00 - addendum 2-2015-07-15
	c-1 site grading plan-add2
	section 00 43 22 - supplementary bid form - unit prices
	section 05 50 00 - metal fabrications
	section 10 28 00 - accessories
	section 10 95 00 - miscellaneous specialties
	1408_accessories schedule-abb_tender_2015-07-15
	1408_accessories schedule_tender_2015-07-15
	1408-00-a003-a003.1_addendum#2
	1408-00-a100-a100.1_addendum#2
	1408-00-a100-a100.2_addendum#2
	1408-00-a120-a120.1_addendum#2
	1408-00-a400-a400.1_addendum#2
	1408-00-a501-a501.1_addendum#2
	1408-00-a503-a503.1_addendum#2
	31 36 00 gabions - add#2 - jul 17 2015
	62601-sr-s001.01-add2
	62601-sr-s101.01-add2
	62601-sr-s500.01-add2
	62601-mr-m100.01-add2
	m106 fire protection plan-add2
	62601-mr-m610.01-add2
	62601-mr-m610.02-add2
	e121-14-011 arviat rcmp elec sk-e1, sk-e2 revised
	E01.pdf
	E02.pdf


